
























































































































































T™M 12/12011

2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

Approved plans bearing the original stamp and signature of the fire alarm

plan reviewer

Original permit is on site.

Fire Review Activity form (plan review comments) if provided.

Proof of current licensing of the technician performing the tests.

Written approvals from the AHJ if partial installation inspections are

requested by the contractor or technician.

Site specific software for software based systems.

Written sequence of operation.

Section 907.2.1.2 Emergency voice/alarm communication system capftions is

Item #10

4.

S.

6.

7.

8.

9.

10.
hereby repealed.

Section 907.2.3 Group E is repealed and replaced with Section 907.2.3 Group E

as follows.

907.2.3 Group E. A manual fire alarm system that activates the occupant

notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in Group E

occupancies. When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke detectors are installed,

such systems or detectors shall be connected to the building fire alarm system.

Exceptions:
A manual fire alarm system is not required in Group E occupancies

with an occupant load of less than 50.
Manual fire alarm boxes are not required in Group E occupancies
where all of the following apply:

1.

2.

(e

2.1.

Interior corridors are protected by smoke detectors.

2.2.

Auditoriums, cafeterias, gymnasiums and similar areas are

2.3,

protected by heat detectors or other approved devices.
Shops and laboratories involving dusts or vapors are protected by

2.4.

heat detectors or other approved devices.
The capability to activate the evacuation signal from a central

2.5.

point 1s provided.
In buildings where normally occupied spaces are provided with a

two-way communication system between such spaces and a
constantly attended receiving station from where a general
evacuation alarm can be sounded, except in location specifically
designated by the fire code official.

Manual fire alarm boxes shall not be required in Group E occupancies

where the building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic

sprinkler system in accordance with 903.3.1.1, the notification

appliances will activate on sprinkler water flow and manual activation

is provided from a normally occupied location.

Section 907.2.7.1 Occupant notification is hereby repealed in its entirety.

52



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

Section 907.2.8.2 Automatic smoke detection system is hereby amended to read
as follows:

907.2.8.2 Automatic smoke detection system. An automatic smoke detection
system that activates the occupant notification system in accordance with Section
907.5 shall be installed throughout all interior corridors serving sleeping units. The
automatic smoke detection system requirement is met only by the installation of
smoke or beam detectors whenever possible. If environmental conditions do not
allow the installation of smoke detectors, fire alarm heat detectors may be used on
a limited basis when approved by the fire code official.

Exception: An automatic smoke detection system is not required in
buildings that do not have interior corridors serving sleeping units and
where each sleeping unit has a means of egress door opening directly to an
exit or to an exterior exit access that leads directly to an exit.

Section [M] 907.2.13.1.2 Duct smoke detection is amended to read to include a
third location as follows:

907.2.13.1.2 Duct smoke detection. Duct smoke detectors complying with
Section 907.3.1 shall be located as follows:
1. In the main return air and exhaust air plenum of each air-conditioning
system having a capacity greater than 2,000 cubic feet per minute (cfm)
(0.94 m3/s). Such detectors shall be located in a serviceable area
downstream of the last duct inlet.

2. At each connection to a vertical duct or riser serving two or more stories
from a return air duct or plenum of an air-conditioning system. In Group
R-1 and R-2 occupancies, a smoke detector is allowed to be used in each
return air riser carrying not more than 5,000 cubic feet per minute (cfm)
fefm} (2.4 m3/s) and serving not more than 10 air-inlet openings.

In systems with open air returns, the duct smoke detector shall be placed
on the supply side.

[t

Section 907.2 Where required — new buildings and structures is amended by
adding Section 907.2.24 High Occupant Load as follows:

907.2.24 Higsh Occupant Load. In addition to the requirements listed in other
sections of this Code. any occupancy having an occupant load of 1000 or more
shall be provided with a manual fire alarm system.

Exception: Open Parking Garages

Sections 907.3 Fire safety functions and 907.3.1 Duct smoke detectors are
hereby amended to read as follows:

53



T™ 12/12011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

907.3 Fire safety functions. Automatic fire detectors utilized for the purpose of
performing fire safety functions shall be connected to the building's fire alarm
control unit where a fire alarm system is required by Section 907.2. Detectors
shall, upon actuation, perform the intended function and activate the alarm
notification appliances or activate a visible and audible supervisory signal at a
constantly attended location. In buildings not equipped with a fire alarm system,
the automatic fire detector shall be powered by normal electrical service and, upon
actuation, perform the intended function. The detectors shall be located in
accordance with NFPA 72, except that duct smoke detectors shall be located in
accordance with the 2012 International Mechanical Code.

907.3.1 Duct smoke detectors. Smoke detectors installed in ducts shall be /isted
for the air velocity, temperature and humidity present in the duct. Duct smoke
detectors shall be connected to the building's fire alarm control unit when a fire
alarm system is required by Section 907.2. Activation of a duct smoke detector
shall initiate a visible and audible supervisory signal at a constantly attended
location and shall perform the intended fire safety function in accordance with this
code and the International Mechanical Code. Duct smoke detectors shall not be
used as a substitute for required open area detection. In systems with open air
returns, the duct smoke detector shall be placed on the supply side.

Exceptions:

H Fhe-supervisory signalai—a—consiantly atiended Hocation—is ot
*Eq.m;w. here Eme'; smoke-detectors-activate the buildings alarm

1.2 In occupancies not required to be equipped with a fire alarm
system, actuation of a smoke detector shall activate a visible and an
audible signal in an approved location. Smoke detector trouble
conditions shall activate a visible or audible signal in an approved
location and shall be identified as air duct detector trouble.

b2

For fire alarm systems which cannot be programmed for
supervisory signals, duct detectors shall be allowed to activate the

alarm signal.

Section 907.3.5 Fire Alarm Systems - Emergency Control is hereby added to
read as follows:

907.3.5 Fire Alarm Systems - Emergency Control. At a minimum, the
following functions, where provided. shall be activated by the fire alarm system:

1. Elevator capture and control in accordance with ASME/ANSI
A17.1b, Safety Code for Elevators and Escalators.
2. Release of automatic door closures and hold open devices.

54



™ 12/172011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

[tem #10

3. Stairwell and/or elevator shaft pressurization.

4. Smoke management and/or smoke control systems.

5. Initiation of automatic fire extinguishing equipment.

6. Emergency lighting control.

7. Unlocking of doors.

8. Emergency shutoff of gas and fuel supplies that may be hazardous
provided the continuation of service is not essential to the
preservation of life.

9. Emergency shutoff of audio systems for sound reinforcement or
entertainment (i.e. music systems. systems for announcement and
broadcast which are separate from public address systems)
provided that such systems are not used to issue emergency
structions.

10. Emergency shutoff of systems used for the creation of displays or
special effects (i.e. lighting effects, laser light shows, projection
equipment)

Section 907.4.2.1 Location is amended to add an exception:

907.4.2.1 Location. Manual fire alarm boxes shall be located not more than 5 feet
(1524 mm) from the entrance to each exit. Additional manual fire alarm boxes
shall be located so that travel distance to the nearest box does not exceed 200 feet
(60 960 mm).

Exception: Where construction of the building prohibits the proper
installation of a manual fire alarm box (e.g. glass walls, interior brick or
rock walls), a manual fire alarm box shall be allowed to be located in the
normal path of egress, where approved by the Fire Marshal or his/her

designee.

Section 907.5.1, Presignal feature, is amended to read as follows:

907.5.1 Presignal features and positive alarm sequences. A Presignal feature
or Positive Alarm Sequence as defined in NFPA 72 shall not be installed unless
approved by the fire code official and the fire department. Request to use a
Presignal feature or a Positive Alarm Sequence must be submitted in writing to
the Fire Marshal and approval granted before installation. Where a Presignal
feature or Positive Alarm Sequence is provided, a signal shall be annunciated at a
constantly attended location approved by the fire department, in order that
occupant notification can be activated in the event of fire or other emergency.
When approved by the fire code official, the Presignal feature or Positive Alarm
Sequence shall be implemented in accordance with the requirements of NFPA 72.

Section 907.5.2.1 Audible alarms is amended by adding Sections 907.5.2.1.3

Testing of Audible Alarms in occupancies other than group R and 907.5.2.1.4 Testing
of Audible Alarms in Group R occupancies as follows:

55



I'™M 12/1/7201 1
ftem #10

2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

907.5.2.1.3 Testing of Audible Alarms in occupancies other than group R.

Audibility levels for all occupancies other than Group R shall be in accordance

with the public mode requirements of NFPA 72. and shall be tested utilizing the

following criteria:

1.

[

[

[

A UL listed sound pressure level meter, which has been calibrated
within the last calendar year, and supplied by the fire alarm system
installing contractor, shall be utilized to obtain readings. The
audiometer will be held five feet above floor, pointed in the
direction of the audible device.

All doors within the occupancy, including bathroom doors and
balconies, shall be in the closed position.

Levels shall be taken in the most remote areas of the occupancy
first, including bathrooms and balconies.

Initial readings to confirm the average ambient sound level in each
area shall be taken.

The fire alarm system shall be activated and readings in the tested
areas shall be retaken and compared with the requirements.

907.5.2.1.4 Testing of Audible Alarms in Group R occupancies. Audibility

levels for all Group R occupancies shall be in accordance with the requirements of

Section 907.5.2.1.1. and shall be tested utilizing the following criteria;

1.

b

[Bed

|

SN

A UL listed audiometer, which has been calibrated within the last
calendar vyear, and supplied by the fire alarm system installing
contractor, shall be utilized to obtain readings. The audiometer will
be held five feet above floor, pointed in the direction of the audible
device.

All doors within the occupancy, including the bathroom and
balcony doors shall be in the closed position.

Ambient sound level shall be established with the television set at
50 percent of maximum volume, showers running. bathroom
exhaust systems running, and air conditioning units running.
Levels shall be taken in the most remote arca of the dwelling or
sleeping unit first, including bathrooms and balconies.

Initial readings to confirm the ambient sound level in each area
shall be taken.

The fire alarm system shall be activated and readings in the tested
areas shall be retaken and compared with the requirements.

Section907.5.2.2, Emergency voice/alarm communication systems, is amended

as follows:

907.5.2.2 Emergency voice/alarm communication systems. FEmergency
voice/alarm communication systems required by this code shall be designed and

installed in accordance with NFPA 72. The operation of any automatic fire

56



I'™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

detector, sprinkler waterflow device or manual fire alarm box shall automatically
sound an alert tone followed by voice instructions giving approved information
and directions for a general or staged evacuation in accordance with the building’s
fire safety and evacuation plans required by section 404 of the International Fire
Code. In high-rise buildings, the system shall operate on a minimum of the
alarming floor, the floor above and the floor below. If the system is not reset
after five minutes, the building shall sound the general evacuation signal and
message in all zones unless an alternative Positive Alarm Sequence has been
approved by the Fire Marshal. Speakers shall be provided throughout the building
by paging zones. At a minimum, paging zones shall be provided as follows:

1. Elevator groups
2. Exit stairways
3. Each floor
4. Areas of refuge as defined in Chapter 2.
Section 907.5.2.2.4Emergency voice/alarm communication captions is hereby
repealed.

Section 907.5.2.3.1 Public and common areas is amended to read:

907.5.2.3.1 Public and common areas. Visible alarm notification appliances
shall be provided in public areas and common areas. Common areas are defined as
an_area that may be shared by two or more individuals (e.g., shared offices,
meeting rooms, conference rooms, huddle rooms, break rooms, storage rooms
with a total area of 100 square feet or more that are accessible from corridors, and
open work areas to which access is not restricted.)

Section 907.5.2.3.4 Group R-2 is amended to read as follows.

907.5.2.3.4 Group R-2. In Group R-2 occupancies required by Section 907 to
have a fire alarm system, all dwelling units and sleeping units shall be provided
with the capability to support visible alarm notification appliances in accordance
with_ICC _A1l17.1 {Chapter10—ofICCAIFH. This requirement is met by
extending the fire alarm wiring to all living areas, restrooms and sleeping areas of
all units. The wiring must terminate in an electrical box suitable for securely
mounting an audio/visual device. Circuits shall be calculated with a minimum 20
percent safety factor available at the end of the circuit.

Exception: Group R-2 complexes that install a minimum of 200% of the

visible and audible alarms required in table 907.5.2.3.3 for Group I-1 and
R-1 occupancies will be exempt from pre-wiring every individual unit

57



I'™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ltem #10

under this section. For this exception to be used, the owner of the complex
must sign and return the Letter of Understanding Form 6007, which can be
obtained from SAFD Fire Prevention. The designer shall calculate the
notification appliances circuits for units so equipped with a minimum
twenty (20) percent safety factor available at the end of the circuit.

Section 907.5.2.3.5 Group R-2 Sleeping Areas is added to read as follows:

907.5.2.3.5 Group R-2 Sleeping Areas. Living rooms in Group R-2 Occupancies
shall have wvisible notification devices that meet the effective intensity
requirements of NFPA 72, Table 7.5.4.6.2 and meet the minimum audibility
requirements of section 907.5.2.1.1.

Section 907.5.2.3.6 Combination Devices is added to read as follows:

907.5.2.3.6 Combination Devices. Combination 120 VAC single or multiple-
station smoke detectors with an onboard visible notification appliance if utilized
to meet the requirements of Section 907.2.11, will not be given credit for meeting
the visible alarm notification requirements of Section 907.5.2.3.4 if these devices
do not have the capability of supplying backup power for the visible notification
appliance portion of the device. Should such devices be utilized to comply with
Section 907.2.11, the visible appliance side of the device shall flash in
synchronization with the notification appliances required in the unit.

SECTION 907 FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS is amended by
adding Section 907.10 Alarm Signal Silencing Switch as follows:

907.10 Alarm Signal Silencing Switch. A switch for silencing the alarm signal
sounding appliances shall be permitted only if it is key operated, located within a
locked cabinet, or requires special knowledge. Such a switch shall be permitted
only if visible zone alarm indication or equivalent has been provided by approved
annunciation, printout, or other approved means, and subsequent alarms on other
initiating devices circuits will cause the audible alarm signaling appliances to
resound. A switch that is left in the "silence" position when there is no alarm shall
operate trouble signals until the switch is restored to normal.

Section 912.3.1 Locking Fire Department Connection Caps is amended to read
as follows:

912.3.1 Locking Fire Department Connection Caps. FDC shall have locking
caps in the following areas/occupancies: The area described in section 11-37 of
these amendments, Group A, E. I occupancies, High-Rise buildings, and any other
location a fire code official determines that a locking cap would be necessary
and/or_beneficial for firefighting needs. {Fhe—fire-code—official-is—authorized-—to

dapnarimaea ata¥s ata) O) Q a A A
[0 OT1] v, v, Af® Cr .

58



T™M 12/1/2011
Item #10

2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

SECTION 912 FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTIONS is amended by adding
Sections 912.7 Fire Department Connections and Table 912.7 as follows:

912.7 Fire Department Connections. Sprinkler system and standpipe fire

department hose connections shall be as follows:

l.

2.

[

|+

4

Within forty (40) feet of a public street, approved fire lane, or access
roadway;

Within 250 feet of an approved fire hydrant measured per hose lay criteria
in Section 507.5.1.2, except for R-2 Apartments in which the fire
department connection shall be within 500 feet of an approved fire hydrant
measured per hose lay criteria in Section 507.5.1.2;

Minimum of two feet above finished grade and a maximum of four feet
above finished grade for standard inlets and minimum of 30 inches at
lowest point above finished grade and maximum of four feet above
finished grade for the five inch “Stortz” inlet;

The Fire Code Official shall approve the location of freestanding fire
department connections. Freestanding FDCs must be physically protected
against_impact per the requirements of Section 312 or other approved
means.

Where provided, the five inch “Stortz” inlet shall be installed at a 30
degree angle pointing down;

Fire department connections for H occupancies will be freestanding
remote and located as determined by the Fire Code Official; and

See table 912.7

Table 912.7
FDC Connections required by System Type

Sprinkler

Either a 5 Inch

Systems:

Stortz inlet or (2)2

Wet
Dry

Y Inch inlets

Standpipes:
Automatic Wet

Automatic Dry
Semiautomatic

Dry

Either a 5 Inch
Stortz inlet or (2)2

¥ Inch inlets

Standpipes:
Manual Wet

Manual Dry

A 5 Inch Stortz inlet for the first 1000 gallons
system demand and an additional 2 % inlet for
each additional 250 gallon demand or portion
thereof

There shall be

no more than one Stortz connection in any configuration

56




['M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

SECTION 1003 GENERAL MEANS OF EGRESS is amended by adding
Section 1003.8 Special Provisions as follows.

1003.8 Special Provisions. Rooms in E occupancies used for kindergarten or
daycare. children five or under, classified as an E occupancy shall not be located
above or below the first story.

Exceptions:
1. Basements or stories having floor levels located within four feet,

measured vertically, from adjacent ground level at the level of exit
discharge., provided the basement or story has exterior exit doors at
that level.

In buildings equipped with an automatic sprinkler system throughout,
rooms used for kindergarten or for daycare purposes may be located on
the second story, provided there are at least two exterior exit doors for
the exclusive use of such occupancies.

>

Section [B]1004.1.2 Areas without fixed seating, is amended to read as follows:

[B]1004.1.2 Areas without fixed seating. The number of occupants shall be
computed at the rate of one occupant per unit of area as prescribed in Table
1004.1.2. For areas without fixed seating, the occupant load shall not be less than
that number determined by dividing the floor area under consideration by the
occupant load factor assigned to the function of the space as set forth in Table
1004.1.2. Where an intended function is not listed in Table 1004.1.2, the building
official shall establish a function based on a listed use that most nearly resembles
the intended function. When the calculated number is not a whole number, it is
required to round up to the next whole number for determination of the occupant
load of a space.

Exception: Where approved by the building official, the actual number of
occupants for whom each occupied space, floor or building is designed, although
less than those determined by calculation, shall be permitted to be used in the
determination of the design occupant load.

Section [B]1006.3 Emergency power for illumination is amended by adding
Section 1006.3.2 Illumination in Group E as follows:

1006.3.2 Hlumination in Group E. Group E occupancies shall have emergency
lichting in interior stairs, corridors, windowless areas with student occupancy,
shops, and laboratories.

SECTION 1007 ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS, is repealed and replaced
with a new SECTION 1007 entitled ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS as follows:

SECTION 1007

60



I'M 12/12011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS

All buildings or portions of buildings must comply with the accessibility standards
adopted by the State. Projects shall be submitted to the Texas Department of Licensing
and Regulation for review, inspection and approval in accordance with State law.

Section [B]1008.1.9.6, Special locking arrangements in Group I-2 is amended to
read as follows:

[B]1008.1.9.6 Special locking arrangements in Group I-2. Where approved by
the fire marshal or his designee, Approved delayed fappreved-—speeial} egress
locks shall be permitted in a Group [-2 occupancy where the clinical needs of
persons that require specialized security measures for their safety (i.e.,
infant/pediatric security safe areas, dementia and Alzheimer's disease care areas,
etc.) freceiving—eare} require such locking. Delayed egress locks on doors,
including stairway doors, [Special—egress—loeks} shall be permitted in such
occupancies where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or an approved automatic
smoke or heat detection system in accordance with section 907, provided that the
doors unlock in accordance with Items 1 through 7 below.

1. The doors unlock upon actuation of the automatic sprinkler system or
automatic fire detection system.

2. The doors unlock upon loss of power controlling the lock of lock
mechanism.

3. The door locks shall have the capability of being unlocked by a signal
from the fire command center, a nursing station or other approved
location.

4. A building occupant shall not be required to pass through more than one
door equipped with a special egress lock before entering an exit.

5. The procedures for the operation(s) of the unlocking system shall be
described and approved as part of the emergency planning and
preparedness required by Chapter 4.

6. All clinical staff shall have the keys, codes or other means necessary to
operate the locking devices.

7. Emergency lighting shall be provided at the door.

Exception: Items 1 through 4 shall not apply to doors to areas where persons,
which because of clinical needs, require restraint or containment as part of the
function of a psychiatric treatment area.

Section [B] 1008.1.9.7, Delayed egress locks is amended to read as follows:

[B]1008.1.9.7 Delayed egress locks. Approved, listed, delayed egress locks shall
be permitted to be installed on doors, including stairway doors in a Group -2
oecupancy, serving any oceupancy exeept Group A, E and H occupancies in
buildings that are equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in

61



™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or an approved automatic smoke or heat
detection system installed in accordance with Section 907, provided that the doors
unlock in accordance with Items 1 through 6 below. A building occupant shall not
be required to pass through more than one door equipped with a delayed egress
Jlock betore entering an exit.

1. The doors unlock upon actuation of the automatic sprinkler system or
automatic fire detection system.

2. The doors unlock upon loss of power controlling the lock or lock
mechanism.

3. The door locks shall have the capability of being unlocked by a signal
from the fire command center.

4. The initiation of an irreversible process which will release the latch is not
more than 15 seconds when a force of not more than 15 pounds (67 N) is
applied for 1 second to the release device. Initiation of the irreversible
process shall activate an audible signal in the vicinity of the door. Once the
door lock has been released by the application of force to the releasing
device, relocking shall be by manual means only.

Exception: Where approved, a delay of not more than 30 seconds is
permitted.

5. A sign shall be provided on the door located above and within 12 inches
(305 mm) of the release device reading: PUSH UNTIL ALARM
SOUNDS. DOOR CAN BE OPENED IN 15 [30] SECONDS.

6. Emergency lighting shall be provided at the door.

Section [B] 1008.1.9.8, Access Controlled egress doors is amended by amending
the first paragraph as follows with the remaining text left as written:

[B]1008.1.9.8 Access Controlled egress doors. The entrance door in a means of
egress in buildings with an occupancy in Groups A, B, E, [-2, M, R-1 or R-2 and
entrance doors to tenant spaces in occupancies in Groups A, B, E, [-2, M, R-1 or
R-2 and interior doors in Group I-2 occupancies, with the approval of the fire
marshal or his designee, are permitted to be equipped with an approved entrance
and egress access controls system, /isted in accordance with UL 294, which shall
be installed in accordance with all of the following criteria:

* * * * *

Section [B] 1008.1.9.11, Stairway doors is amended by adding exception 6 as
follows:

[B]1008.1.9.11 Stairway doors. Interior stairway means of egress doors shall be
openable from both sides without the use of a key or special knowledge or effort.

Exceptions:

62



TM 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

1. Stairway discharge doors shall be openable from the egress side and shall
only be locked from the opposite side.

This section shall not apply to doors arranged in accordance with Section
403.5.3 of the International Building Code.

In stairways serving not more than four stories, doors are permitted to be
locked from the side opposite the egress side, provided they are openable
from the egress side and capable of being unlocked simultaneously
without unlatching upon a signal from the fire command center, if present,
or a signal by emergency personnel from a single location inside the main
entrance to the building.

4. Stairway exit doors shall be openable from the egress side and shall only
be locked from the opposite side in Group B, F, M and S occupancies
where the only interior access to the tenant space is from a single exit stair
where permitted in Section 1021.2.

Stairway exit doors shall be openable from the egress side and shall only
be locked from the opposite side in group R-2 occupancies where the only
interior access to the dwelling unit is from a single exit stair where
permitted in Section 1021.2.

This section shall not apply to stairway doors in Group [-2 occupancies
(excluding nursing homes where 24-hour care is not provided at all times)
if the stairway doors are equipped with delayed egress locks in accordance
with Section 1008.1.9.6 or Section 1008.1.9.7 of the International Fire
Code.

o

(™)

wn

|9

Section 1103.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings is
amended to read as follows:

1103.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings. Existing
buildings that do not have approved radio coverage for emergency responders
within the building based upon the existing coverage levels of the public safety
communication systems of the jurisdiction at the exterior of the building, shall be
equipped with such coverage according to one of the following:

1. Emergency responder radio coverage as required in section 510 of this

code is installed within a time frame established by the adopting authority.

e

An approved alternative method of emergency responder communication
within the building is provided within a time frame established by the

adopting authority .[Within—a—time—frame—established by —the—adopting
atrthory-

Exception: Where it is determined by the fire code official that the radio

coverage system is not needed.

63



T™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ltem #10

Sections 1103.4.2 Vertical openings three to five stories, 1103.4.4 Atriums and
covered malls, 1103.4.5 Escalators in Group B and M occupancies, 1103.4.6 Escalators
in four or fewer stories, 1103.6 Standpipes and 1103.7.6 Group R-2 are all hereby
repealed.

Section 1103.8 Single and multiple-station smoke alarms is amended to add an
exception as follows:

1103.8 Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms. Single-and multiple-station
smoke alarms shall be installed in existing Group I-1 and R occupancies in
accordance with Sections 1103.8.1 through 1103.8.3.

Exception: All R3 occupancies not used for commercial purposes.
including duplexes and houses for rent.

Section 1103.8.1 Where required is amended by deleting the first two exceptions
as follows:

1103.8.1 Where required. Existing Group I-1 and R occupancies shall be
provided with single-station smoke alarms in accordance with Section 907.2.11,
except as provided in Section 1103.8.2 and 1103.8.3.

Exception{si:

64



I'M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

1. 3 Where smoke detectors connected to a fire alarm system have been
installed as a substitute for smoke alarms if installed in all sleeping
areas as prescribed in 907.2.11.

Section 1103.8.2 Interconnection is amended by altering the two exceptions as
follows:

1103.8.2 Interconnection. Where more than one smoke alarm is required to be
installed within an individual dwelling or sleeping unit, the smoke alarms shall be
interconnected in such a manner that the activation of one alarm will activate all
of the alarms in the individual unit. The alarm shall be clearly audible in all
bedrooms over background noise levels with all intervening doors closed.

Exceptions:

1. Interconnection is not required in buildings that are not undergoing
alterations Lrepairs-er-eonstruction-of-anyldnd].

2. Smoke alarms in existing areas are not required to be interconnected
where alterations do not result in the removal of interior wall or

ceiling finishes exposes the structure f-unless-there-is—an-attic;erawl
.i, i i be Lof interior f ; hes},

Section 1103.8.3 Power source is amended by adding two new exceptions as
Jfollows:

1103.8.3 Power source. Single-station smoke alarms shall received their primary
power from the building wiring provided that such wiring is served from a
commercial source and shall be equipped with a battery backup. Smoke alarms
with integral strobes that are not equipped with battery backup shall be connected
to an emergency electrical system. Smoke alarms shall emit a signal when the
batteries are low. Wiring shall be permanent and without a disconnecting switch
other than as required for overcurrent protection.

Exceptions:

1. Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated in existing
buildings where no construction is taking place.

2. Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated in buildings

that are not served from a commercial power source.

65



™M 12/12011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

Item #10

3. Smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery operated in existing
areas of buildings undergoing alterations or repairs that do not result in
the removal of interior walls or ceiling finishes exposing the structure,
unless there is an attic, crawl space or basement available which could
provide access for building wiring without the removal of interior
finishes.

4. In all R-2 occupancies, smoke alarms are permitted to be solely battery
operated if added to complv with 1103.8.
5. In_ all R-2 occupancies, smoke alarms are permitted to be operated

solely from the building wiring if installed prior to the adoption date of
this code.

Section 1103.9 Carbon Monoxide alarms is amended to read as follows:

1103.9 Carbon monoxide alarms. Existing Group I ferR} occupancies located
in a building containing a fuel-burning appliance or a building which has an
attached garage shall be equipped with single-station carbon monoxide alarms.
The carbon monoxide alarms shall be listed as complying with UL 2034, and be
installed and maintained in accordance with NFPA 720 and the manufacturer’s
instructions. An open parking garage, as defined in the International Building
Code, or an enclosed parking garage ventilated in accordance with Section 404 of
the International Mechanical Code shall not be deemed to be an attached garage.

Exception: Sleeping units or dwelling units which do not themselves contain
a fuel-burning appliance or have an attached garage, but which are located in a
building with a fuel-burning appliance or an attached garage, need not be
equipped with single-station carbon monoxide alarms provided that:

1. The sleeping unit or dwelling unit is located more than one story
above or below any story that contains a fuel-burning appliance or an
attached garage;

2. The sleeping unit or dwelling unit is not connected by duct work or
ventilation shafts to any room containing a fuel-burning appliance or to
an attached garage; and

3. The building is provided with a common area carbon monoxide alarm
system.

Section 1104.1 General is amended to read as follows:

1104.1 General. Means of egress in existing buildings shall comply with the
minimum egress requirements when specified in Table 1103.1 as further
enumerated in Sections 1104.2 through 1104.24, or the building code that applied
at the time of construction, if in the opinion of the fire code official, they do not
constitute a distinct hazard to life. Existing buildings that were not required to
comply with a building code at the time of construction shall comply with the
minimum egress requirements when specified in Table 1103.1 as further
enumerated in Sections 1104.2 through 1104.24 and, in addition, shall have a life

66



M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

safety evaluation prepared, consistent with the requirements of Section 104.7.2.
The life safety evaluation shall identify any changes to the means of egress that
are necessary to provide safe egress to occupants and shall be subject to review
and approval by the fire code official. The building shall be modified to comply
with the recommendations as set forth in the approved evaluation.

Section 1104.5 Illumination emergency power is amended as follows.

1104.5 Illumination emergency power. The power supply for means of egress
illumination shall normally be provided by the premises' electrical supply. In the
event of power supply failure, illumination shall be automatically provided from
an emergency system for the following occupancies where such occupancies
require two or more means of egress:

8. Group R-2 in interior stairs and corridors only.
Exception: Where each dwelling unit or sleeping unit has direct access to the
outside of the building at grade.

Section 1104.16.2 Protection of openings is hereby repealed in its entirety.

Section 1104.16 Fire escape stairs is amended by adding Section 1104.16.8
Exterior Fire Escape as follows:

1104.16.8 Exterior Fire Escape. Any existing exterior fire escape which is
deemed to be an adequate fire escape under the laws of the State or under the
provisions of the City fire prevention regulations shall be deemed an adequate
means of egress for emergency use as required by this chapter and the number of
existing exterior fire escapes shall be provided to comply with the fire escape law
of the State and the City fire prevention regulations.

TABLE 1104.17.2 COMMON PATH, DEAD-END AND TRAVEL DISTANCE
LIMITS (by occupancy) is amended by altering the wnumber—of—"Dead—tnd—-Limit"
Sprinklered-tfeet) chart for the fottowing groups listed from-30-to—70: as shown below.

TABLE 1104.17.2
COMMON PATH, DEAD-END AND TRAVEL DISTANCE LIMITS (by
occupancy)

67



I'™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ftem #10
OCCUPANCY |COMMON PATH LIMIT DEAD-END LIMIT TRAVEL DISTANCE
LIMIT
Unsprinklered |Sprinklered |Unsprinklered |Sprinklered |Unsprinklered |Sprinklered
(feet) (feet) (feet) (feet) (feet) (feet)
Group B 75 100 50 70 {564 200 300 {256}
Group E 75 75 20 70 £561 200 250
Group F-1d, S-1{75 100 50 70 6% 200 250
Group F-2d, $-2{75 100 50 70 {561 300 400
Group I-1 75 75 20 70 (561 200 250
Group M 75 100 50 70 £561 200 400
(Covered Mall)
Group M 75 100 50 70 {563 200 250
(Mercantile)
Group R-1 75 75 50 70 {564 200 250
(Hotels)
Group R-2 75 125 1754 50 70 {563 200 250
(Apartments)
Group U 75 10075 |20 70 £564 300 {2664 400 2564

Section 1104.21 Exterior stairway protection is hereby repealed.

Section 1104.24 Egress path markings is hereby repealed.

Section 2108.2 Automatic sprinkler system is amended by adding exceptions to

read as follows:

2108.2 Automatic sprinkler system. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 throughout dry cleaning plants
containing Type II, Type ITFA or Type III-B dry cleaning systems.

Exceptions:

1.

Automatic sprinklers are not required in dry cleaning plans where the quantity

of Class II solvent in dry cleaning machines and storage does not exceed 150

gal. and dry cleaning machines are equipped with instrumentation, equipment.

or controls that provide any one of the following:

a.

b.

C.

Features that limit oxygen concentrations to less than eight percent by

volume

Features that limit solvent vapor concentrations to less than 25 percent

by volume

Features that incorporate an integral automatic fire extinguishing

system

68




™™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

2. Automatic sprinkler systems are not required in dry cleaning plants where the
quantity of Class IIIA solvent in dry cleaning machines and storage does not
exceed 330 gal and dry cleaning machines are equipped with instrumentation,
equipment., or controls that provide any one of the following:

a. Features that limit oxyvgen concentrations to less than eight percent by

volume

b. Features that limit solvent temperatures to less than 30 degrees F below
their flash point

¢. Features that limit solvent vapor concentrations to less than 25 percent
of the LEL

d. Features that incorporate equipment approved for use in Class I,
Division 2 hazardous locations
e. Features that incorporate an integral automatic fire extinguishing
system
3. Dry cleaning plants where the quantity of Class IIIB solvent in dry cleaning
machines and storage does not exceed 3300 gals.

SECTION 2301 GENERAL is amended by adding Section 2301.7 Portable
Service Stations as follows:

2301.7 Portable Service Stations.

1. No person shall own, operate or maintain a tank used for the storage of
flammable liquids maintained on skids or a similar type stand which is
designed or intended to be used for dispensing flammable liquids into the fuel
tanks of motor vehicles owned by the public.

e

The foregoing provisions of this article are intended to prohibit the use of so-
called portable service station or similar units constructed to dispense
flammable liquids to the motoring public and designed so that the unit can be
easily picked up and moved.

Section 2306.2.1.1 Inventory Control for underground tanks is amended to read
as follows:

2306.2.1.1 Inventory Control for underground tanks.
1. Accurate daily (normal working days only) inventory records shall be

" maintained and reconciled on all Class I, II or III-A liquid fundergreund}
storage tanks for indication of possible leakage from tanks or piping. The

records shall be made available fkept-at-the-premises—or-made-available] for
inspection by the Fire Marshal Hire-code-official-within24-hours-ofa—vwaitten

or—verbal-request], and shall include, as a minimum, records showing by {fer
each} product; {shewing} daily reconciliation between sales, use, receipts, and

inventory on hand. If there is more than one system consisting of a tank(s),
serving_pump(s), or dispenser(s) for any product. the reconciliation shall be

made separately for each tank system. [Where-there-is-mere-than-one-system

69



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

Daily inventory shall be maintained for each tank system at each location by
the operator. The inventory records shall be kept for a minimum of the past 12
months at the premises.

Inventory shall be based on the actual daily measurement and recording of
tank product and water levels and the daily recording of actual sales, use and
receipts. Daily measurements shall be made by gauge, gauge stick or by
readout from an automated gauging system. The inventory records shall
include a daily compilation of gain or loss. The mere recording of pump meter
reading and product delivery receipts shall not constitute adequate inventory
records.

The operator of the location shall be held responsible for notifying the owner
or person(s) in control of the facility to take action to correct any abnormal
loss or gain not explainable by spillage. temperature variations or both causes.

The Fire Marshal may require the operator of an underground tank storage
system to test the system for tightness, at the operator's expense, when
accurate daily inventory records have not been maintained as required or when
in his judgment conditions indicate possible leakage of product from the
location of such tanks.

The Fire Marshal may require copies of Class I, II and III-A liquid storage
tank inventories, deliveries or receipt of product sales and dip gauge stick
readings or other control measures in addition to copies of any tank tightness
or line leakage test results from the station operator, agent, or terminal
management.

When a service station tank is found to be leaking, its contents shall be
removed immediately. If any investigations or tests indicate the source of such
loss, the owner shall take immediate action to correct the system failure and
remove dangerous spillage from the environment.

The Fire Marshal may order the closure of a Service Station by barricading if
necessary and the emptying of contents from storage tanks should the operator
of a service station be unwilling to cooperate with the Fire Department during
the search for the source of such leakage or should the Fire Marshal determine
that a hazardous condition exists that merits such action.

b

[«

|+

|

|2

I~

|oo

Section 2306.2.3 Above-ground tanks located outside, above grade is amended
by adding Sections 2306.2.3.1 Inspections, 2306.2.3.2 Required Access, and 2306.2.3.3
Fire Hydrant Access as follows:

2306.2.3.1 Inspections. An inspection of the installation shall be conducted prior
to loading the tank with fuel. For those installations approved by the Fire Chief or
his designee to dispense class 1 liquids, the initial loading of fuel shall be
witnessed by the fire inspector.

70



T™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ltem #10

2306.2.3.2 Required Access. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided for
every aboveground storage tank. The aboveground storage tank shall not be more
than 150 feet from fire apparatus access roads as measured by an approved route.

2306.2.3.3 Fire Hydrant Access. A minimum of one fire hydrant shall be
provided for every aboveground storage tank. The aboveground storage tank shall
not be located more than 500 feet from a fire hydrant as measured by an approved
route.

SECTION 2809 EXTERIOR STORAGE OF FINISHED LUMBER
PRODUCTS is amended by adding Section 2809.6 Lumber storage other than
commercial lumber dealers us follows:

2809.6 Lumber storage other than commercial lumber _dealers. It shall be
unlawful for any person within the City limits to place, pile, or cause to bg placed
or piled, any lumber or timber to a greater height than six feet at the top most
portion from ground level. Storage of lumber in such instances must allow at least
an 18 inch space from ground level to bottom of the lumber pile. Such pile must
be at least three feet from any adjoining property line and total pile area shall not
exceed 100 square feet. Any lumber stored or kept upon, or in, any premises in the
City must be piled in a neat and orderly manner free from rubbish or other waste
materials. Nothing in this section shall apply to storage of lumber by commercial
lumber dealers.

Section 3103.2 Approval required is amended to read as follows:

3103.2 Approval required. Tents and membrane structures used for assembly
purposes having an occupant load over 50, and all other occupancies having an
area in excess of 1200 square feet fhavingan-area-in-exeess-of-400-squarefeet-(37
m%} shall not be erected, operated or maintained for any purpose without first
obtaining a permit and approval from the fire code official.

Section 3103.4 Permits is amended to read as follows:

3103.4 Permits. Permit to operate a tent or air supported structure shall consist of
a Certificate of Occupancy issued by Development Services. {Permits—shall-be

Section 3301.3 Address numbers, is added to read as follows.

3301.3 Address numbers. Buildings under construction shall place address
numbers and/or building numbers in a position that is plainly legible and visible
from the street or road fronting the property with minimum six inch numbers.

Section 3314.3 Furniture, Fixtures, and Equipment is hereby added as follows:

71



I'™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ltem #10

3314.3 Furniture, Fixtures, and Equipment. In buildings where and automatic
sprinkler system is required, furniture, fixtures, and equipment shall not be stored
in the building until the system has been tested and approved by the fire code
official and monitoring of system is active.

Exception: As approved by the fire code official.

CHAPTER 37 entitled AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS is hereby added to
read as follows.

CHAPTER 37 AUTOMOBILE WRECKING YARDS

3701.1 Automobile dismantling and storage.

1. Nothing but automobile dismantling shall be carried on in any automobile
wrecking vard or establishment, and if repairs are made to any automobile or
other self-propelled vehicle, such repairs shall be made in a building meeting
all the requirements of a public automobile garage or automobile repair shop
and in keeping with the regulations for such occupancy.

10

All gasoline shall be drained from the gasoline reservoirs of all automobiles or
other self-propelled vehicles stored or kept on the premises, unless such
automobiles or vehicles are in such state of repair as to enable them to be
removed from the premises under their own power.

CHAPTER 38 entitled PROTECTION OF OUTDOOR STORAGE is hereby
added to read as follows:

CHAPTER 38 PROTECTION OF OUTDOOR STORAGE

3801 GENERAL

3801.1 The hazards of exposure to outdoor storage from ignition sources and
exposing fires and the infinite variety of conditions under which such exposures
can occur render impossible the formulation of any single table, formula, or set of
rules that can cover all conditions adequately.

3801.2 In general. the provision of automatic fire protection is impractical for
outdoor storage. As a result, the following is required:

1. Control of potential ignition sources such as from exposing buildings,
transformers, yard equipment, refuse burners, overhead power lines, and
vandals:

72



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ftem #10

2. Elimination of adverse factors such as trash accumulations, weeds, and
brush;

3. Provision of favorable physical conditions such as limited pile sizes, low
storage heights, wide aisles, and possible use of fire-retardant covers (e.g.,
tarpaulins);

4. Rapid and effective application of manual fire-fighting efforts by the

provision of fire alarms, strategically located hydrants, and adeguate hose
houses or hose reels.

3801.3 Outdoor storage is acceptable for materials that are as follows:

1. Of low fire hazard, not requiring protection even if located indoors

Of sufficiently low value that a potential loss would not justify the
utilization of building space

Of such severe fire hazard that indoor protection is impractical when
balanced against potential loss of large volume and bulk., making it
impractical to construct and protect a building to house the storage.

j

3801.4 Where materials that normally would be stored in buildings are stored
outdoors in temporary emergencies, special precautions shall be taken for their
safeguard and that they be moved to a storage warechouse as soon as possible.

3802 Responsibilities of Management

3802.1 It is the responsibility of management to properly consider the hazards of
the various materials handled. Protection requirements and storage arrangements
vary _with the combustibility of the materials. The care, cleanliness, and
maintenance exercised by management determine to a large extent the relative fire
safety in the storage area.

3803 Site

3803.1 In selecting a site for outdoor storage. the following requirements shall be
followed:

1. Adequate public water system with hydrants suitably located for protection of
the storage.

2. Adequate all-weather roads for fire department apparatus response.

73



T™ 12/172011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

Item #10

3. Sufficient clear space from buildings or from other combustible storage that
constitutes an exposure hazard.

4. Absence of flood hazards.

5. Adequate clearance space between storage piles and any highways, bridges,
railroads, and woodlands.

6. Topography as level as possible to provide storage stability.

Adequate clearance between the storage of combustible materials and
pipelines, pipe bridges, cable trays and electrical transmission lines.

3803.2 The entire site shall be surrounded by a fence or other suitable means to
prevent unauthorized access. An adequate number of gates shall be provided in
the surrounding fence or other barriers to permit ready access of fire apparatus.

3804 Material Piling

3804.1 Materials shall be stored in unit piles as low in height and small in area as
is consistent with good practice for the materials stored. The maximum height
shall be determined by the stability of pile, effective reach of hose streams,
combustibility of the commodity, and ease of pile breakdown under fire or mop-
up conditions. Under no circumstances shall the pile size dimensions exceed 50
feet by 150 feet by 20 feet high unless the specific commodities maximum
dimensions are listed elsewhere in the code.

3804.2 Aisles shall be maintained between individual piles, between piles and
buildings, and between piles and the boundary line of the storage site. Sufficient
driveways having the width of at least 20 ft shall be provided to allow the travel of
fire equipment to all portions of the storage area. Aisles shall be at least twice the
pile height to reduce the spread of fire from pile to pile and to allow ready access
for fire fighting, emergency removal of material, or salvage purposes.

3804.3 As the commodity class increases in combustibility or where storage could
be ignited easily from radiation, wider aisles shall be provided. Smaller unit piles
could be an alternative to wider aisles if yard space is limited.

3804.4 Boundary posts with signs designating piling limits shall be provided to
indicate yard area. roadway. and aisle limits.

3805 Buildings and Other Structures

3805.1 Yard storage. particularly storage of commodities in the higher heat
release category, shall have as much separation as is practical from important

74



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
{tem #10

buildings and structures, but not less than that offered by NFPA 80A.,
Recommended Practice for Protection of Buildings from Exterior Fire Exposures.

3805.2 As guidance in using NFPA 80A to establish clear spaces, the following
classification of severity with commodity classes of this standard shall be used on
the basis of 100 percent openings representing vard storage:

1. Light severity—Commodity Class |

2. Moderate severity—Commodity Class 11

3. Interpolate between moderate and severe severity for Commodity Class I11

Severe severity—Commodity Class IV and Class A plastics

The guidelines of Section 3805.2 apply to the equivalent commodity classes of
this standard. The severity of the exposing building or structure also shall be a
consideration where establishing a clear space.

3806 Yard Maintenance and Operations

3806.1 The entire storage site shall be kept free from accumulation of unnecessary
combustible materials. Vegetation shall be kept to a maximum of four inches
high. Procedures shall be provided for weed control and the periodic cleanup of

the vard area.

3806.2 No heating equipment shall be located or used within the storage area.
Salamanders, braziers. portable heaters. and other open fires shall not be used.

3806.3 Smoking shall be prohibited, except in locations prominently designated as
smoking areas. "No Smoking" signs shall be posted in prohibited areas.

3806.4 Welding and cutting operations shall be prohibited in the storage area.

3806.5 Tarpaulins used for protection of storage against the weather shall be of
fire-retardant fabric.

3806.6 Motorized vehicles using gasoline, diesel fuel, or liquefied petroleum gas
as fuel shall be garaged in a separate. detached building.

3807 Fire Protection

3807.1 Fire extinguishers of an appropriate type shall be placed at well-marked
strategic_points throughout the storage area so that one or more portable fire
extinguisher units can guickly be made available for use at any point. Where the

75



'™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ftem #10

climate 1s such that there is a danger of freezing. suitable extinguishers for
freezing temperatures shall be used.

3808 Storage of Idle Pallets

3808.1 General. Idle pallets shall be stored outside or in a separate building
designed for pallet storage, unless permitted in Section 4808.2.

3808.2 Indoor Storage. Idle pallets shall be permitted to be stored in a building
used for other storage or other purpose. if the building is sprinklered in
accordance with NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems.

3808.3 Outdoor Storage. Idle pallets stored outside shall be stored in accordance
with Table 3808.3 (a) and Table 3808.3 (b).

Table 3808.3 (a) Required Clearance Between OQutside Pallet Storage and Other
Yard Storage.

Minimum Distance
Pile Size |m |ft
Under 50 (6.0 (20
pallets
50—200 (9.1 130
pallets
Over 200 {15.2150
pallets

Table 3808.3 (b) Required Clearance between Outside Pallet Storage and Building

76



I'™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item £10

Minimum distance of Wall from Storage
Wall Construction <50 pallets 50 to 200 pallets |>200 pallets
Wall Type Openings m ft m ft m ft
Masonry None 0 0 0 0 4.6 15
Wired glass with |0 0 3.0 10 6.1 20
outside
sprinklers and 1
hr doors
Wired or plain  |3.0 10 - |6.1 20 9.1 30
glass with
outside
sprinklers and %
hr doors
Wood or 3.0 10 6.1 20 9.1 30
metal with
outside
sprinklers
Wood, metal 6.1 20 9.1 30 15.2 50
or other

Section 5003.4.1 Material Safety Data Sheet Submittal is added to read as
follows:

5003.4.1 Material Safety Data Sheet Submittal. The Fire Marshal may require
that_information on the nature of any and all potentially hazardous material be
submitted to the Fire Department on the Standard Material Safety Data Sheet
provided by the U.S. Department of Labor Occupational Safety and Health
Administration.

Section 5206 Construction and Protection Requirements is added to read as
follows:

5206 Construction and Protection Requirements.

1. Handling and storage of large quantities of waste paper, rags, or other
combustible materials shall not be allowed in a building of any type in excess
of 1500 square feet area unless the building is protected with an approved
automatic sprinkler system.

Handling and storage building for waste paper, rags or other combustible
materials shall not exceed one story in height unless of Type I construction
and fully protected with approved automatic sprinkler system.

b2

77



M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

No loose waste paper, rags, trash or rubbish of any kind, or similar
combustible materials shall be allowed on the premises on the outside of any

building.

=

=

Bales, waste paper, rags, and other combustibles in baled lots shall be stored
in buildings. Said buildings shall be required to have aisles when 25,000 cubic
feet or more of such materials are stored. Baled materials, if stored outside of
buildings, shall not be stored within 25 feet of any building. EXCEPTION:
Baled materials may be stored within 25 feet of a building's outside wall when
a wall sprinkler curtain is provided on the building.

Section 5601.1.3.1 Unlawful Possession of Fireworks, 5601.1.3.2 Instigating or
Aiding a Minor to Violate the Ordinance Prohibiting Fireworks, and 5601.1.3.3
Summons to be issued for Violation of Fireworks Ordinance are added to read as
follows:

5601.1.3.1 Unlawful Possession of Fireworks. It shall be unlawful for any
person to have, keep, store, sell, offer for sale, give away, use, transport or
manufacture fireworks or pyrotechnics of all kinds in any quantity, within the
corporate limits of the City, or to sell or offer for sale, such fireworks within an
area extending 5000 feet beyond the City limits. Exception: A state or federally
licensed importer or distributor established within said 5000 foot area prior to the
enactment of this section and using area for storage or for distribution to or sale to
governmental agencies or federal or state licensees or permitees.

5601.1.3.2 Instigating or Aiding a Minor to Violate the Ordinance
Prohibiting Fireworks. No person shall furnish money or a thing of value to a
minor for the purchase of fireworks or encourage, act in conjunction with or in
any manner instigate or aid a minor in the act of having, keeping, storing, selling,
offering for sale. giving away. using. transporting, or manufacturing fireworks
within or 5000 feet beyond the corporate limits of the City. Such actions shall
constitute Class C misdemeanors and be punished by a fine not to exceed
$2.000.00.

5601.1.3.3 Summons to be issued for Violation of Fireworks Ordinance. A
summons or notice to appear in answer to a charge of illegal possession or use of
fireworks in violation of this section specifying the location of such violation, the
date and time of such violation, and the name and address of the offender, may be
issued by any Police Officer, Arson Investigator, Fire Inspector or by any Firemen
who has been assigned to citation duties by the Fire Chief.

Section 5601.2 Permit required is amended by adding new Sections 5601.2.5
Congested Areas through 5601.2.14 Appeals to the Board of Appeals Concerning
Explosives Permits as follows:

78



'™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

5601.2.5 Congested Areas. When explosives or explosive ingredients are stored,
handled, used or transported or processed in congested mercantile, industrial,
commercial or other heavily populated areas, the explosive permit must be
countersigned by the Fire Chief and the Chief of Police or by a person authorized
to act for each. No explosive permit for use in these areas shall be valid unless it
bears the signature of each of the above-named officials.

5601.2.6 Prohibited Explosives. It shall be unlawful for any person to have,
keep, store, sell, offer for sale, give away, use, transport or manufacture any of the
explosives listed in Section 5601.3 any quantity, within the corporate limits of the
City. or to store, sell, use or offer for sale such explosives within 5000 feet beyond
the City limits unless authorized by the Fire Marshal.

5601.2.7 Applicant Qualifications. Only those persons who have proven to the
Fire Marshal by examination or actual test or by check references of three persons
not related to the applicant, or by all those means, that they are qualified to
manufacture, store, handle, use, transport, or possess explosives and ingredients
and who have proved to the satisfaction of the Fire Marshal that they have read, or
have had read to them, and understood the provisions of this section shall be given
an explosives permit. Applicants who fail the written examination may repeat the
exam after 30 days. Those failing the test the second time may retake the test for
the third time after 90 days. Persons failing the test three times will not be
permitted to repeat test for one year from date of last test taken.

5601.2.8 Inspection Required. Upon receipt of an application for a permit,
special permit or certificate of fitness as required by this chapter, the Fire Marshal
shall make or cause to be made an investigation to determine if all conditions of
this article applying to the permit specified are fulfilled, and if the Fire Marshal
shall find that the things required to be set forth and are true and that the
requirements of this article are fulfilled, the permit or certificate herein mentioned
shall be issued.

5601.2.9 Purpose Specified. Explosive permit shall specify the purpose for which
the explosives or other ingredients are to be manufactured, stored, handled,
transported or possessed, and the maximum amount that will be allowed.

5601.2.10 Application for Permit.

1. All applications for permits shall be in writing. Every person applying for an
explosives permit must appear in person before the Fire Marshal or his

authorized representative. Government departments, firms, corporations,

partnerships, contractors, or other legal entity may obtain explosive permits

through a person authorized to act for or assumed legal responsibility for

them.

The Fire Marshal shall not issue an explosive permit if he receives a written

objection from the City Manager, Chief of Police or from persons authorized

to act for them.

|t

79



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

il

The Arson Division shall do a computer investigation check based on the
information on the application.

Every person applying for a permit must be able to read and write the English
language.

The Fire Marshal or his designate may request written comments on each
permit_application from the various affected City of San Antonio utilities or
franchise holders. When. in the opinion of the Fire Marshal. such utility or
franchise holder has a valid objection to the issuance of a permit, no permit
shall be approved until such objection has been resolved to the satisfaction of
the Fire Marshal or his designate.

When, in the opinion of the Fire Marshal or his designate. there is a
substantial danger to life, health, or property in the immediate area exposed to
the blasting for which a permit is being requested, said permit may be denied.

[

5601.2.11 Records. Permits shall be numbered consecutively on an annual basis
and the Fire Marshal shall keep an accurate and complete record of all explosives
permits issued.

5601.2.12 Permit Limitations.
1. Explosives Handling Permits may be issued for a period, not to exceed one
year from date of issuance, deemed advisable by the Fire Marshal.
2. No employee of a government department, firm, partnership or individual
shall be issued an explosives handlers permit unless his employer first obtains
an explosives site permit.
An employee's explosive permit shall become void if his employer's explosive
permit is revoked or expires without being renewed.
Permits shall be unassignable and nontransferable, and no person shall operate
under. or have the benefit of, another person's permit.
The Fire Marshal shall revoke an explosive permit for violation of any of the
provisions of this chapter. The offender shall have the right to appeal the Fire
Marshal's revocation decision.
The death of any permittee, shall. ipso facto, immediately render the permit
void, and the personal representative or heirs of the decedent must apply for a
permit to cover remaining explosives or ingredients or uncompleted
operations requiring a permit. If a permittee is discharged from his
employment, his permit shall become immediately void and shall be delivered
to his employer, who must deface it by writing across the face thereof the
word "Void", together with a notation of the date and reason for the voidance,
and thereafter mail or deliver it to the Fire Marshal, and the employer must at
once take possession and charge of any explosives or ingredients for which the
permittee was accountable. In the event of the dissolution or transfer of the
business of any permittee, the successor in interest of the permittee shall
immediately apply for a permit to cover any explosives. ingredients or
operations relating to same.
In the event of the banktuptcy of a permittee, the trustee or receiver of his
bankrupt estate shall immediately apply for a permit to cover any remaining

(et

|

[

|o

I~

80



T™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

explosives, ingredients, or operations relating thereto. The permit shall not
pass with any forced sale or other forced transfer of explosives, ingredients, or
operations covered by it, and the transferee must immediately apply for a
permit to cover same.

8. Any permit that becomes void during the period for which it was issued shall
be returned within ten days to the Fire Marshal and it shall be accompanied
with all Photostat copies that have been made.

9. The Fire Marshal shall be notified of the loss or destruction of any valid

permit.

5601.2.13 Blasting Site Permits.

1. Blasting permits shall be issued by the Fire Marshal and shall set forth the
name of the contractor or other responsible party applying, the name of the

property owner upon whose property the blasting is to be done and the

location of the property. Such permit shall be valid and operative for a period

not to exceed 90 days from date issued, except for quarry operation permits,

which shall be issued for a period not to exceed one year.

The Fire Marshal shall not issue a permit for quantities to exceed one hundred

pounds of high or low explosives, five hundred electric blasting caps, or 25

pounds of black powder of any kind, without the approval of the Board of

Appeals.

The Fire Marshal may limit the quantity of explosives or blasting agents to be

permitted at any location.

The Fire Marshal may defer the issuance of an explosives permit in order to

make any such investigation as he deems necessary.

N2

ed

5601.2.14 Appeals to the Board of Appeals Concerning Explosives Permits.
Any person who has been refused issuance of an explosive permit or who has had
his explosive permit revoked may appeal such action by notifving the chairman of
the Building-related and Fire Codes Appeals and Advisory Board in writing
within 10 days after he has received notice of such refusal or revocation,

Section 5602.1 Definitions is amended by adding one definition as follows:

5602.1 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this
chapter and as used elsewhere in this code, have the meanings shown herein.

* * * * *

HIGHWINDS. Sustained wind velocity of 15 mph or gusts of 25 mph.

Section 5607.1 General is amended by adding Section 5607.1.1 Conditions of
Approval as follows.

81



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

5607.1.1 Conditions of Approval. The Fire Marshal shall set other conditions to
the approval of a permit application that are necessary, in his opinion, to
adequately protect the public health and safety. These conditions may include, but
are not limited to, reduced allowable particle velocities, additional monitoring,
increased insurance protection, hours of operation, type and amount of explosives
used and engineered blasting plans.

Section 5607.4 Restricted hours is amended to read as follows:

5607.4 Restricted hours. Except by written approval by the Fire Marshal, no
blasting operations shall be conducted on Saturdays, Sundays or legal holidays or

between the hours of 5: 00 p.m. and 8:00 a.m. {S&r—faee—bl—astmg—epem&eﬂs—shaﬂ

Section 5607.14 Post-blast procedures is amended by adding Section 5607.14.1
Removal of Equipment as follows:

5607.14.1 Removal of Equipment. All exposed blasting cap lead wires in the
ground from previous shots shall be removed at the end of the workday.

SECTION 5607 BLASTING is amended by adding Sections 5607.16 Particle
Velocity Permitted through 5607.20 Detonating Cord as follows:

5607.16 Particle Velocity Permitted. A particle velocity of 1.7 inches per second
will be the maximum velocity allowed by permit. One and seven-tenths (1.7)
inches per second particle velocity or above will require the immediate suspension
of blasting and corrective procedures implemented to reduce the excess velocity.
The Fire Marshal may grant or require variances from this limit to adequately
protect the public safety.

5607.17 Blast Monitor Required. A blast monitor, such as a seismic blast-
recording machine, is required in connection with all permits issued inside the
City limits of San Antonio unless specifically exempted by the Fire Marshal.
Recordings shall comply with Bureau of Mines Standards for safety and property

protection.

5607.18 Trunk Wire Requirements. Only blasting trunk wire of 18 gauge
minimum will be used while conducting blasting operations by permits.

5607.19 Approved Equipment Required. Only approved blasting machines may
be used. Car, truck, motorcycle, boat batteries. or power lines are prohibited as

being unsafe.




TM 12/172011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

5607.20 Detonating Cord. Detonating cord may be used only when approved on
the blasting permit. Unauthorized use of detonating cord shall result in the
suspension of the blasting permit and/or blaster's license.

Section 5608.1 General is amended by adding Sections 5608.1.1 Public Displays
- Duties of the Operator through 5608.1.5 Fire Inspectors to be Present as follows:

5608.1.1 Public Displays - Duties of the Operator. The operator of a public

fireworks display shall comply with the following:

1. The minimum radius of the secured area surrounding a fireworks display (the
minimum safe distance between the mortar site and spectators) shall be 70 feet

per shell inch of the largest shell to be fired. Spectators shall be restrained

using a barrier approved by the Fire Marshal. Security officers shall be
provided and assigned as approved by the Fire Marshal.

Fire projectiles:

a) So that the range of aerial display shall be not more than 200 feet and the
fireworks shall be discharged vertically from steel or other approved tubes;
or

b) So that they will impact in a body of water;

Maintain an unobstructed spatial separation of’

a. 600 feet between the ignition point and a school;

b. 200 feet between the ignition point and a highway, railroad, or building
other than a school; and

¢. 50 feet between the ignition point and an overhead obstruction.

Discontinue the display if the wind carries fireworks debris to adjoining

property: and

Immediately after display:

a. Secarch the display site for unfired fireworks or fireworks debris; and

b. Safely dispose of any unfired fireworks or fireworks debris in the
prescribed by the Fire Marshal.

oo

et

|-+

|

5608.1.2 Fireworks Permits. Possession and use of fireworks and pyrotechnics
shall be allowed in connection with a fireworks display in celebration of a
recognized holiday under the following conditions:;

1. The site of the display has been previously approved by the Fire Marshal;

2. The display is within 10 days of a federal, state or city holiday, and is in
connection with a public holiday celebration;

The display is to be held under the supervision of the Fire Marshal or his
representative. In addition to other violations contained in this chapter, it shall
be unlawful for any person in conducting such a display, or storing or moving
explosives preparatory to such an event, to fail to adhere to all specifications
and directions of the Fire Department representative supervising such event.

[

5608.1.3 Materials Not to be Stored in City. The material to be used for a public
display authorized by this division shall not be stored within the City limits, but

83



I'™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

shall be brought in on the day of the public display and then shall be taken
immediately to the place of display for further handling and storage.

5608.1.4 Limitation on Time and Number of Displays. No display authorized
by this division shall be commenced prior to the hour of 1:00 P.M. nor later than
10:00 P.M. Sundays through Thursdays and no later than 11:00 P.M. on Fridays
and Saturdays.; however, fireworks displays may be commenced between the
hours of 10:00 P.M. on December 31 of any vear and between the hours of
midnight and 1:00 A.M. on January | of any year if such displays comply with all
other requirements of this code. Any display authorized by this division shall be
completed within one hour after the time the display is commenced, and no permit
shall authorize more than two displays in each 24 hours.

5608.1.5 Fire Inspectors to be Present. For each public display of fireworks
under this division, not less than two Fire Prevention officers of the city shall be
in attendance during the display. If more than two fire inspectors are required or
the inspector's work takes longer than two hours, the additional expense shall be
borne by the applicant for the permit at the rate per man-hour as provided for in
Section 11-16(k) of the City Code. The Fire Chief may require standby
firefighting unit at the expense of the applicant.

Section 5608.2.2 Use of pyrotechnics before a proximate audience is amended
by adding Section 5608.2.2.1 Inside Use of Pyrotechnics as follows:

5608.2.2.1 Inside Use of Pyrotechnics. The use of pyrotechnics inside of a
building shall be unlawful unless authorized and approved in writing by the Fire
Marshal prior to the issuance of a permit. The Fire Marshal may require the owner
or_person in possession or control of the building or premises to provide without
charge to the department a technical opinion and report stating whether harmful
smoke would be produced and pose a health hazard to the public. The opinion and
report shall be prepared by a qualified engineer, specialist, laboratory, or fire
safety specialty organization acceptable to the Fire Marshal and the owner. A
permit for the use of pyrotechnics shall be issued when approved by the Fire
Marshal. Application for a permit shall be made in writing 10 days prior to the use
of pyrotechnics.

Section 5608.2 Permit application is amended by adding Sections 5608.2.3
Procedure for Applying; Permit for Fireworks Display through 5608.2.8 Duties of
Permittee as follows:

5608.2.3 Procedure for Applying; Permit for Fireworks Display.
A permit applicant shall, at least 10 days before using fireworks, file with the Fire
Marshal a completed permit application showing the:
a) Pyrotechnics:
1. DBusiness address,
2. Proof of legal competency; and

84



T™ 12/12011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

[tem #10

3. Record of previous experience with fireworks;

Address of the proposed display:

Amount, type, and class of fireworks to be used;

Address of the company supplying the fireworks:

Date of proposed display:

Starting and ending times of the proposed display; and

Diagram of the proposed display grounds, detailing:

Firing points

Location of buildings and highways on or adjoining the grounds;

Spectator restraining lines; and

4. Overhead obstructions.

h) Completed permit application to the Fire Marshal including the surety
bond or insurance coverage required by State Law.

Rl

aall hadl Il

The Fire Marshal shall, within five days from date of the completion of the

requirements in Subsection (1) of this section, approve or refuse to approve the

permit. If the Fire Marshal refuses to approve issuance, he shall immediately send

to

the applicant by certified mail. return receipt requested., a written statement

explaining the basis of the refusal.

The permittee shall notify in writing, at least 48 hours prior to consideration by

the Fire Marshal, all residents within 1000 feet of a proposed fireworks site.

5608.2.4 Refusal to Issue. The Fire Marshal may refuse to approve issuance of a

permit if the applicant:

1.

Bl el I

I

|o

Intentionally makes a false statement as to a material matter in the permit
application;

Is a fugitive from justice;

[s under a felony indictment:

Has been finally convicted of a felony offense within that five year period
immediately preceding the filing of the application:

Has been finally convicted of a misdemeanor violation of an explosives law or
regulation within the two vyear period immediately preceding filing of the
application;

Held a permit issued under this article, which permit was revoked within that
one vear period immediately preceding the filing of the application;

Has been adjudicated a mental defective; is an unlawful user of, or addicted
to, a controlled substance or dangerous drug, or suffers from any other
handicap, infirmity, defect, or condition which might reasonably diminish his
competency to safely conduct the proposed activity or would create an
unreasonable risk of injury to life or property in the performance of the
proposed activity.

5608.2.5 Revocation of Permit. The Fire Marshal shall revoke a permit if the

permittee:

85



I'™M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

1. Intentionally makes a false statement as to a material matter in the permit
application;

>

Knowingly allows another to use his permit;

Violates a term or condition of the permit;

Fails within the applicable time period to comply with an order or notice on
him under this article; or

5. Fails to discharge a duty imposed on him by this Section.

The Fire Marshal shall, within five davs from the date of revocation, send to the
permittee by certified mail, return receipt requested. a written statement
explaining the basis of the revocation.

5608.2.6 Appeal of Permit Refusal or Revocation. If the Fire Marshal refuses to
issue a permit under this section, that action is final unless the applicant or
permittee, within 10 days after receiving a written notice of the action, files a
written appeal with the chairman of the Board of Appeals.

5608.2.7 Bond. The permittee shall furnish a bond or certificate of insurance in
the minimum amount of one million dollars. The Fire Marshal may increase the
amount of the required bond or insurance when he deems it advisable.

5608.2.8 Duties of Permittee. A permittee shall:
1. Upon request, make his permit available for inspection to a member of the
Fire Department, Police Officer, or any other authorized person;

|n>

Notify the Fire Marshal of the loss or destruction of an unexpired permit,
notice to be given immediately upon discovery of the loss or destruction;

Secure a replacement permit for that lost or destroyed;

=

Comply immediately with the Fire Marshal's order to dispose of fireworks
which become hazardous during the performance of this permitted activity:
and

Return his permit to the Fire Marshal immediately upon its expiration,
together with a statement detailing the cause of expiration and the disposition
of unused fireworks.

[

Section 5701.4 Permits is amended by adding Section 5701.4.1 Permit Required
Prior to Installation as follows:

86



I'M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ltem #10

5701.4.1 Permit Required Prior to Installation. Permit to install tanks shall be
applied for to the Fire Department before installation is begun. Application for
permit shal] be accompanied by a diagram or drawing on scale showing the
proposed location of the tank with reference to nearby buildings, streets, and
waterways and showing in detail all proposed pipelines, pumps and other
improvements. Applications for installation over the Edward's Aquifer shall be
reviewed by the Aquifer Study Division of the San Antonio Water System prior to
submittal to the Fire Department for a permit,

Section 5703.6 Piping systems is amended by adding Section 5703.6.12
Pressurized Piping as follows:

5703.6.12 Pressurized Piping. Where a pressurized (remote pumped) piping
system is connected to a tank, the piping system shall have an approved leak
detection device installed in the system to monitor for leaks in the piping.

Section 5704.2.11.5.2 Leak Detection is amended by adding the approved
methods to read as follows:

5§704.2.11.5.2 Leak Detection. Underground storage tank systems shall be
provided with an approved method of leak detection from any component of the
system that is designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 30.The following
are approved methods of leak detection:

Manual tank gauging (for tanks less than 1,000 gallons);

Automatic tank gauging and inventory control;

Vapor monitoring;

Groundwater monitoring;

Interstitial Monitoring of double-wall systems:;

Monitoring of systems with secondary containment barriers:

Statistical Inventory Reconciliation (SIR) - (for tanks and lines) NOTE:
Documentation of performance claims for the SIR method must show the
system's ability to detect releases of 0.1 g.p.h. with 95% or more probability of
detection and five percent or less probability of false alarm.

[ [ B [ 9 =

Section 5704.2.12.2 Testing of underground tanks is amended to read as
follows:

5704.2.12.2 Testing of underground tanks. Before being covered or placed in
use, tanks and piping connected to underground tanks shall be tested for tightness
in the presence of the fire code official. Piping shall be tested in accordance with
Section 5703.6.3. The system shall not be covered until it has been approved.
Each tank shall be tested for tightness hydrostatically or pneumatically at not less
than three pounds per square inch or not more than five pounds per square inch
for 60 minutes. Pneumatic testing shall not be used on a tank containing
tlammable or combustible liquids or vapors.

87



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ftem #10

Section 5704.2.12.2 Testing of underground tanks is amended by adding
Sections 5704.2.12.2.1 Existing Tanks and Piping and 5704.2.12.2.2 Alternate Test
Method as follows:

5704.2.12.2.1 Existing Tanks and Piping. Existing underground storage tanks
and piping shall be tested for leakage every five years at the owner's or operator's
expense or when the Fire Marshal has reasonable cause to believe a leak exists. A
log or record shall be kept and the log shall be made available for inspection by
the Fire Marshal when requested. Notice of test shall be provided in writing to the
Fire Marshal by the owner or operator.

5704.2.12.2.2 Alternate Test Method. The Fire Marshal may require that the
standpipe method of testing for tank leaks be utilized if in the Fire Marshal's
opinion the air pressured tests would be unlikely to detect a leak, cause damage to
tank or cause expulsion of contained liquids.

Appendix B FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS is hereby
amended by adding an exception to section B104.2 Area Separation:

B104.2 Area Separation. Portions of buildings which are separated by fire walls
without openings, constructed in accordance with the International Fire Code, are
allowed to be considered as separate fire-flow calculation areas.

Exception: Where building additions are protected with an approved automatic
sprinkler system and separated from the existing building by an approved Fire
Barrier with minimum fire resistance ratings and protected openings as per the
International Building Code, fire areas may be considered as separate.

Appendix B FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS is hereby
amended by amending section B105.2 Buildings other than one-and -two family
dwellings to delete the exception and adding 2 new exceptions and a new Table B105.2:

B105.2 Buildings other than one-and -two family dwellings. The minimum
fire-flow and flow duration for buildings other than one- and two-family
dwellings shall be as specified in Table B105.1.

Exception 1. Buildings equipped throughout with an approved automatic

sprinkler system in accordance with Sections 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, or 903.3.1.3
shall gualify for a reduction in the required fire flow according to Table B105.2

8§



T™ 12/1/2011
[tem #10

2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

below. Note also the minimum and maximum fire flows listed in the table for the

fully sprinklered occupancies listed.

Table B105.2—Fire flow reductions for fully sprinklered buildings

Construction Occupancy Typed4, 5 % Minimum Maximum
Type Reduction (gpm) (gpm)

All A 15 1,500 2,000

VB, l1IB. 1IB B 50 1,500 2,200

All Others B 30 1,500 2.000

All E 15 1.500 2.000

VB, 1B, lIB F 50 1,500 2,200

All Others I 50 1,500 2,000

All H-1 See Footnotes 1.500 See Footnotes
All H-2 See Footnotes 1,500 See Footnotes
All H-3 See Footnotes 1.500 See Footnotes
All H-4 See¢ Footnotes 1.500 See Footnotes
All H-5 See Footnotes 1,500 See Footnotes
All 1 15 1.500 2.000

VB, [lIB, 1IB M 50 1.500 2.200

All Others M 50 1,500 2,000

All R 50 1,500 2.000

All except VB2 | S-1 not high piled 30 1,500 2,200

All except VB2

S-1 high piled Class }-IV commodities. <

12,000 sq ft.

Greater of Approved Sprinkler Demand3 (ASD) or
1,500 gpm

All except VB2

S-1 high piled Class I-IV commodities

Greater 0of 2.200 gpm or the ASD + 25%

>12.000 sq ft

All except VB2

S-1 high piled Class V commodities, <

2,500 sq ft.

Greater of 1,500 gpm or the ASD

All except VB2

S-1 high piled Class V commodities

2.501-6.000 sq ft

Greater of 1,500 gpm or the ASD + 500 gpm

All except VB2

S-1 high piled Class V commodities

Greater 0of 2,200 gpm or the ASD + 1,000 gpm

>6.000 sq ft

All except VB2 S-1 Aircraft 50 1,500 2.200
Hangers. Helistops
All except VB2 S-2 50 1.500 2.200

Footnotes:

1. As determined by Fire Marshal on a case by case basis.

89



I'M 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
[tem #10

1

=

[+

o

These occupancies that are constructed of Type VB construction shall not be granted a reduction in
the required fire flow due to the installation of a fire sprinkler system.

Approved sprinkler demand (ASD) is the sprinkler demand as defined in NFPA or other nationally
recognized standards and includes the hose stream demand. When multiple sprinkler systems are in
one building, the approved sprinkler demand shall be the greatest sprinkler demand (including
hose stream demand).

Occupancies containing High Piled Combustible Storage as defined in Chapter 32 shall be
evaluated using the criteria for S-1 occupancies.

Mixed-use occupancies shall be evaluated for the most restrictive occupancy present in the

Exception 2. Non-fire sprinklered, non-combustible open parking garages
meeting the requirements of the 2012 International Building Code Section 406.3
shall have a maximum required fire flow of 2.200 gpm.

Appendix C FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION is hereby

amended by amending Table C105.1 NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE
HYDRANTS by deleting the Average Spacing Between Hydrants and Maximum
Distance from Any Point on Street or Road Frontage to a Hydrant columns of the

chart

to read as follows:

TABLE C105.1 Number and Distribution of Fire Hydrants

MAXIMUM-DISTANCE
AVERAGE SRACING EFROM-ANY-ROINT ON
PRE-FLOW MINIMUM NUMBER OF
REQUIREMENT (gpm) HYDRANTS m sw
HYDRANT®

1,750 or less 1 500 250
2,000-2,250 2 450 225
2,500 3 450 225
3,000 3 480 226
3,500-4,000 4 350 210
4,500-5,000 5 308 180
5,500 6 300 180
6,000 6 250 150
6,500-7,000 7 250 450
7,500 or more 8 or more 200 120

For St

1foot= 304.8 mm, 1 gallon per minute = 3.785L/m.

a. Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

b. Where streets are provided with median dividers which cannot be crossed by fire fighters pulling hose lines, or where arterial
streets are provided with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count of more than 30,000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing

shall average 500 feet on each side of the street and be arranged on an alternating basis up to a fire-flow requirement of

7.000

c. Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of structures of similar fire

gallons per minute and 400 feet for higher fire-flow requirements.

problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to provide for transportation hazards.
d. Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads.
e. One hydrant for each 1, 000 galions per minute or fraction thereof.

90




T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ftem #10

Appendix D FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS is hereby amended by
repealing Section D103.6 Signs and adding a new Section D103.6 Signs to read as
Jfollows:

D103.6 Signs.

D103.6.1 Roads 20 to 26 feet in width. Fire lane signs in accordance with
Section 503.3 of this code shall be posted on both sides of fire apparatus access
roads that are 20 to 26 feet wide (6096 to 7925 mm).

D103.6.2 Roads more than 26 feet in width. Fire lane signs in accordance with
Section 503.3 of this code shall be posted on one side of fire apparatus access
roads more than 26 feet wide (7925 mm) and less than 32 feet wide (9754 mm).

Appendix D FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS is hereby amended by
repealing Section D104.1 Building exceeding three stories or 30 feet in height.

Appendix D105 AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS is hereby
amended by adding an exception to both D105.1 Where required and D105.2 Width and
modifying the maximum distance an access route may be located from the building in
D105.3 Proximity to building as follows:

D105.1 Where required. Where the vertical distance between the grade plane
and the highest roof surface exceeds 30 feet (9144 mm), approved aerial fire
apparatus access roads shall be provided. For the purposes of this section, the
highest roof surface shall be determined by measurement to the eave of a pitched
roof, the intersection of the roof to the exterior wall, or the top of parapet walls,
whichever is greater.

Exception: Aerial fire apparatus access roads per this section are not required
for Group R buildings that meet all of the following:

1. The building is no more than four stories in height.

The building is protected by an NFPA 13 sprinkler system.

The building meets the allowable area provisions of Chapter 5 of the
International Building Code without the use of the area increase factor
due to sprinkler protection. (Note: Refer to IBC Equation 5-1.)

=

91



T™ 12/1/2011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
Item #10

D105.2 Width. Aerial fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum
unobstructed width of 26 feet, exclusive of shoulders, in the immediate vicinity of
the building or portion thereof.

Exception: An aerial apparatus access lane may be less than twenty-six
(26)ft wide where a minimum 25ft wide fire lane or fire apparatus access
road is provided throughout the platted property.

D105.3 Proximity to building. At least one of the required access routes meeting
this condition shall be located within a minimum of 15 feet 4572-mm) and a

maximum of 39 feet 30—feet(H44—-mmH

from the building. and-shal-be

I } ha a Q b Q ats¥a a¥a ata¥=Va Iy atatiyal $75Va B A

fire-eode-offtetald The road shall be positioned parallel to the side(s) where the
aerial _access equipment will have maximum use and access by the fire
department. The Jength of the aerial apparatus road shall comply with both of the
following:

1. 75% of the long side, but not less than the entire length of the short side of the

building.
2. 30% of the entire building perimeter.

Appendix D FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS is hereby amended by
amending section D106.3 Separate Access Roads to read as follows:

D106.3 Separate Access Roads. The requirement for two separate and approved
fire apparatus access roads are met with the following conditions:
1. A minimum of two separate entrances into the complex are made from the

street or public way.
2. The distance between the two entrances are equal to not less than one half the
length of the maximum overall diagonal dimension of the property or area to
be served, measured in a straight line between accesses, as per 2012 IFC,
section D104.3.
Exception: Where it is physically impossible to _be one half the diagonal
dimension apart, the access road will be approved if the following conditions
are met:

a. The two separate fire apparatus access road must be separated as far as

physically and practically possible.
b. The two separate entrances must be a minimum of 150 feet apart
measured in a straight line between accesses.

The two separate entrances are allowed to share a common path of travel on
the complex site so long as blockage in any one area of this path does not
block access from both the primary and secondary access simultaneously. The
two separate entrances are allowed to share a common path of travel on the
complex site so long as blockage in any one area of this path does not block
access from both the primary and secondary access simultaneously. Each of

ed

92



T™ 12/172011 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE
ltem #10

the two separate fire apparatus roads shall meet the requirements of the 2012
IFC., section 503, Fire Apparatus Access Roads.

SECTION 5. All previous provisions of the 2009 International Fire Code with local
amendments as adopted by the City of San Antonio, Texas, shall remain in full force and
effect during the period for which they were enacted. Three copies of the 2012
International Fire Code and local amendments have been filed in the office of the City
Clerk, pursuant to section 17 of the Charter for permanent record and inspection.

SECTION 6. Should any Article, Section, Part, Paragraph, Sentence, Phrase, Clause, or
Word of this ordinance, or any appendix thereof, for any reason, be held illegal,
inoperative, or invalid or if any exception to or limitation upon any general provision
herein contained be held to be unconstitutional or invalid or ineffective, the remainder
shall, nevertheless, stand effective and valid as if it had been enacted and ordained
without the portion held to be unconstitutional or invalid or ineffective.

SECTION 7. There is no financial impact as a result of the passage of this ordinance.

SECTION 8. No other provision of the City Code is amended hereby. All other
provisions shall remain in effect.

SECTION 9. The City Clerk for the City of San Antonio is hereby directed to publish
notice of this ordinance in a newspaper published in the City of San Antonio, Texas, as
required by Article 2, Section 17 of the City Charter of San Antonio, Texas.

SECTION 10. The publishers of the City Code of San Antonio are authorized to amend
said Code to reflect the changes adopted herein, to correct typographical errors and to
index, format and number paragraphs to conform to the existing code.

SECTION 11. This ordinance shall become effective on the 1* day of March, 2012,

PASSED AND APPROVED this 1* day of December, 2011.

Julian Castro

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:
- -
LAtia M. ﬁcek, (Z{ty Clerk Michael D. Bernard, City Attorney

. 7



VotingResults

Heques? for

Agenda Voting Results - 10

City of FER

Page 1 of 1

Name:

4,5,6,7,10, 12A, 12B, 12C, 12D, 13, 14, 16, 18, 19, 20, 21

Date:

12/01/2011

Time:

09:44:35 AM

Vote Type:

Motion to Approve

Description:

An Ordinance authorizing the 2012 International Fire Code Adoption with
amendments, along with the Building related codes and local amendments as
reviewed in the triennial publication of the International Fire Code for the
2012 adoption cycle. [Erik J. Walsh, Deputy City Manager; Charles N. Hood,

Fire Chief]

Result:

Voter

Passed

Group Not

Present

Yea

Nay

Abstain

—_———————— —  __ ___ _———————— — _ _________—————— |

Motion

Second

Julian Castro

Mayor

4

Diego Bernal

District 1

Ivy R. Taylor

District 2

Jennifer V. Ramos

District 3

Rey Saldana

District 4

David Medina Jr.

District 5

ESTIE I T B I

Ray Lopez

District 6 X

Cris Medina

District 7

W. Reed Williams

District 8

Elisa Chan

District 9

Carlton Soules

District 10

E T I B Bl

http://cosaweb/agendabuilder/votingresults.aspx?ItemId=8546&Src=RFCA

12/1/2011



