
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 30, 2008 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

For: Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks 
Terex Utilities, Inc. Cooper Equipment 

Co.
Hall Volvo GMC Grande Truck 

Center
Grande Truck 
Center

Grande Truck Center

ND P.O. Box 1119 17474 Judson Rd. 5721 Hwy 31 West P.O. Box 201210 4562 IH 10 East P.O. Box 201210

Item Description QTY

San Antonio, TX 
78294
(210) 476-7777

San Antonio, TX 
78247
(210) 657-5151

Tyler, TX 75709
(903) 592-6151

San Antonio, TX 
78220
(210) 666-7112

San Antonio, TX 
78219
(210) 666-7112

San Antonio, TX 
78220
(210) 666-7112

1 7 C.Y. Dump Trucks, Min 35,000 Lbs. 
GVWR 3
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $69,288.00 No Bid $68,504.00
Price Total $207,864.00 $205,512.00

Less trade in Unit #2417: $13,550.00 $13,550.00
Less trade in Unit #1371: $10,550.00 $10,550.00
Less trade in Unit #2420: $13,550.00 $13,550.00
Total Less trade-ins:  $170,214.00 $167,862.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Sterling 2009 Sterling 
Model of Cab & Chassis Acterra Acterra
Make of Transmission Allison Allison
Model of Transmission 3500 RDS 3500 RDS
Make of Engine Cummins Cummins
Model of Engine ISC 260 HP ISC 260 HP
Make of Body SA Brake & Clutch Davis 
Model of Body PTD 400 T107 TA 7-10 

Delivery 150-180 days 150-180 days

2A Cab and Chassis, Min 52,000 Lbs. 
GVWR, 102" usable cab to axle 6
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $81,293.00
Price Total $487,758.00

Less trade in Unit #1196: $11,550.00
Less trade in Unit #1200: $12,550.00
Less trade in Unit #1222: $12,550.00
Less trade in Unit #1226: $12,550.00
Less trade in Unit #1231: $12,550.00
Less trade in Unit #1198: $11,550.00
Total Less trade-ins:  $414,458.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Sterling
Model of Cab & Chassis LT 9513
Make of Transmission Fuller
Model of Transmission FRO 15210 C
Make of Engine Detroit 
Model of Engine 60-14.0 L 455HP
Make of Body SA  Brake 
Model of Body PTD Wet Kit

Delivery 150-180 days

2B Cab and Chassis, Min 52,000 Lbs. 
GVWR, 102" usable cab to axle with 
winch 3
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105,076.00
Price Total  $315,228.00

Less trade in Unit #1257: $14,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1335: $17,500.00
Less trade in Unit #1391: $17,500.00
Total Less trade-ins: $266,228.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Sterling
Model of Cab & Chassis LT 9513
Make of Transmission Fuller
Model of Transmission FRO 15210 C
Make of Engine Detroit
Model of Engine 60-14.0L 455HP

Make of Body
Wabash 

Trailer/Braden
Model of Body Wet Kit / HP75 A

Delivery 180-220 days

08-054
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 30, 2008 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

For: Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks 
Terex Utilities, Inc. Cooper Equipment 

Co.
Hall Volvo GMC Grande Truck 

Center
Grande Truck 
Center

Grande Truck Center

ND P.O. Box 1119 17474 Judson Rd. 5721 Hwy 31 West P.O. Box 201210 4562 IH 10 East P.O. Box 201210

Item Description QTY

San Antonio, TX 
78294
(210) 476-7777

San Antonio, TX 
78247
(210) 657-5151

Tyler, TX 75709
(903) 592-6151

San Antonio, TX 
78220
(210) 666-7112

San Antonio, TX 
78219
(210) 666-7112

San Antonio, TX 
78220
(210) 666-7112

08-054

3 Cab & Chassis, Min 50,000 Lbs. GVWR, 
12 CY Dump Trucks

14

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $90,507.00 No Bid $88,373.00
Price Total  $1,267,098.00 $1,237,222.00

Less trade in Unit #1271: $22,500.00 $22,500.00
Less trade in Unit #1336: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1337: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1338: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1344: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1345: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1346: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1347: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1348: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1349: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1358: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1362: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1378: $18,000.00 $18,000.00
Less trade in Unit #1377: $18,000.00 $18,500.00
Total Less trade-ins: $1,010,598.00 $980,222.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Sterling 2009 Sterling
Model of Cab & Chassis LT9500 LT9500
Make of Transmission Fuller Fuller
Model of Transmission FRO 15210 C FRO 15210 C
Make of Engine Detroit Detroit
Model of Engine MBE 4000 MBE 4000 435HP
Make of Body SA Brake & Clutch Davis
Model of Body  PTD 500T14 FMT 10-14

Delivery 130-180 days 130-180 Days

4 Deleted

5 Min 35,000 Lbs. GVWR, 2,000 Gallon 
Water Distribution Trucks

4

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $79,777.00 No Bid $89,323.00
Price Total  $319,108.00 $357,292.00

Less trade in Unit #1232: $15,900.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00
Less trade in Unit #1234: $15,900.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00
Less trade in Unit #4524: Deleted Deleted Deleted
Less trade in Unit #1235: $15,900.00 $16,500.00 $16,500.00
Total Less trade-ins: $47,700.00 $269,608.00 $307,792.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Sterling 2009 Sterling
Model of Cab & Chassis Acterra Acterra
Make of Transmission Allison Allison
Model of Transmission 3500 RDS 3500 RDS
Make of Engine Cummins Cummins
Model of Engine ISB 240 HP ISB 260HP
Make of Body CT &E Etnyre

Model of Body
2200 Gal. Water 

System 1900 Gal. Pressure 

Delivery 120-165 days 120-165 days

6 Truck, Paint Striper 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid $338,595.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Total $338,595.00  

Less trade in Unit #1460: $10,800.00 $12,000.00
Total Less trade-in: $327,795.00 $12,000.00

Make of Cab & Chassis GMC
Model of Cab & Chassis TT8F042
Make of Transmission Allison
Model of Transmission  3500 RDS
Make of Engine Isuzu 
Model of Engine 6H 7.8L  300 HP
Make of Body MRL 
Model of Body 4-4000

Delivery 150-180 days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 30, 2008 Bid # 1 Bid # 2 Bid # 3

For: Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks 
Terex Utilities, Inc. Cooper Equipment 

Co.
Hall Volvo GMC Grande Truck 

Center
Grande Truck 
Center

Grande Truck Center

ND P.O. Box 1119 17474 Judson Rd. 5721 Hwy 31 West P.O. Box 201210 4562 IH 10 East P.O. Box 201210

Item Description QTY

San Antonio, TX 
78294
(210) 476-7777

San Antonio, TX 
78247
(210) 657-5151

Tyler, TX 75709
(903) 592-6151

San Antonio, TX 
78220
(210) 666-7112

San Antonio, TX 
78219
(210) 666-7112

San Antonio, TX 
78220
(210) 666-7112

08-054

7 Cab & Chassis, Min 35,000 GVWR Lbs,  
Digger Derrick, 120" cab to axle

1

Price Each $147,180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $146,765.00
Price Total $147,180.00 $146,765.00

Less trade in Unit #1449: $27,000.00 $27,000.00
Total Less trade-in: $120,180.00 $119,765.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Sterling 2009 Sterling 
Model of Cab & Chassis Acterra Acterra
Make of Transmission Allison Allison
Model of Transmission 3000 Series RDS 3000 RDS
Make of Engine Cummins Cummins
Model of Engine 8.3  300 HP ISC 315 HP
Make of Body Terex Telelect Terex Telelect
Model of Body CMDR 4042  Commander 4042

Delivery 240-270 days 240-270 days

8 Cab & Chassis, Min 24,000 GVWR Lbs, 
with flare bodies. 

3

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56,903.00
Price Total $170,709.00

Less trade in Unit #1180: $7,500.00
Less trade in Unit #1181: $7,500.00
Less trade in Unit #1272: $7,500.00
Total Less trade-ins: $148,209.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Ford
Model of Cab & Chassis F750
Make of Transmission Allison 
Model of Transmission 2500 RDS
Make of Engine Cummins
Model of Engine ISB 240HP
Make of Body Walbash
Model of Body Flare Body

Delivery 120-180 days

9 Cab & Chassis, Min 35,000 Lbs GVWR, 
with Fuel & Lube Bodies

2

Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130,406.00
Price Total $260,812.00

Less trade in Unit#1091 $17,500.00
Less trade in Unit#1092 $17,500.00
Total Less trade-ins: $225,812.00

Make of Cab & Chassis 2009 Sterling
Model of Cab & Chassis Acterra
Make of Transmission Allison
Model of Transmission 3000 RDS
Make of Engine Cummins 
Model of Engine ISC 315HP
Make of Body CTE
Model of Body Fuel & Lube body

Delivery 150-220 days 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 30, 2008

For: Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks 

ND

Item Description QTY
1 7 C.Y. Dump Trucks, Min 35,000 Lbs. 

GVWR 3
Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #2417:
Less trade in Unit #1371:
Less trade in Unit #2420:
Total Less trade-ins:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery 

2A Cab and Chassis, Min 52,000 Lbs. 
GVWR, 102" usable cab to axle 6
Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #1196:
Less trade in Unit #1200:
Less trade in Unit #1222:
Less trade in Unit #1226:
Less trade in Unit #1231:
Less trade in Unit #1198:
Total Less trade-ins:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery

2B Cab and Chassis, Min 52,000 Lbs. 
GVWR, 102" usable cab to axle with 
winch 3
Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #1257:
Less trade in Unit #1335:
Less trade in Unit #1391:
Total Less trade-ins:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine

Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery

08-054

Bid #1 Bid # 2
Santex Truck 
Center, Ltd.

Sterling & Western 
Star of Austin, Ltd.

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

French Ellison Truck 
Center

1380 Ackerman Rd. 1700 Smith Rd. 8700 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 9010 IH 10 East
San Antonio, TX 
78219
(210) 661-8371

Austin, TX 78721
(888) 661-8611x134

Converse, TX 
78109
(210) 277-4373

Converse, TX 78109
(210) 277-4373

Converse, TX 
78109
(210) 662-9333

$68,871.00 $68,662.00 $71,604.00 $69,384.00 $73,391.00
$206,613.00 $205,986.00 $214,812.00 $208,152.00 $220,173.00

$13,750.00 No Bid $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $16,000.00 
$5,000.00 No Bid $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $12,000.00 

$13,750.00 No Bid $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $16,000.00 
$174,113.00 $205,986.00 $199,312.00 $192,652.00 $176,173.00

International Sterling Freightliner Freightliner 2009 Kenworth
4400 Acterra M2-106 M2-106 T-370

Allison Allison Allison Allison Allison
3500 RDS 3000 RDS 3500 RDS 3500 RDS 3500 RDS

International Cummins Cummins Cummins Paccar
Maxforce DT ISC-260  260 HP ISC-260 260HP ISC 260 PX-8 260 HP

Davis Ox Body Warren TBEI- Ox Bodies Warren 
TA710    10' Maverick  4451 10' Maverick 6451-10

180 days 90-120 days Not Provided 75-120 days 120 days

$89,493.00 $80,872.00 No Bid 81,456.00 $93,201.00
$536,958.00 $485,232.00 488,736.00 $559,206.00

$14,000.00 No Bid 8,500.00 $10,000.00
$16,500.00 No Bid 9,000.00 $12,000.00
$16,500.00 No Bid 9,000.00 $12,000.00
$16,500.00 No Bid 9,000.00 $12,000.00
$16,500.00 No Bid 9,000.00 $12,000.00
$14,000.00 No Bid 8,500.00 $10,000.00

$442,958.00 $485,232.00 435,736.00 $491,206.00

International Sterling Freightliner 2009 Kenworth
5900I LT9500 CL120 T-800
Fuller  Fuller Fuller Fuller

FRO-16210 C FRO-15210 B FRO-15210 B FRO-14210 B
Cummins Detroit Detroit Diesel Cummins

ISX  420 Net HP  DDC 60-14.0L Series 60-14.0 L ISX-400
Not Provided Not Provided Not Provided N/A

Wet Kit Wet Kit Wet Kit N/A

180 days 90-120 days 75-120 days 120 days

$110,019.00 $107,562.00 No Bid $108,531.00 $115,998.00
$330,057.00 $322,686.00 $325,593.00 $347,994.00

$25,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $12,000.00 
$27,000.00 No Bid $12,500.00 $14,000.00 
$27,000.00 No Bid $12,500.00 $14,000.00 

$251,057.00 $322,686.00 $290,593.00 $307,994.00

International Sterling Freightliner 2009 Kenworth
5900I LT9500 CL 120 T-800
Fuller  Fuller Fuller Fuller

FRO-16210 C FRO-15210 C FRO-15210 B FRO-14210 B
Cummins Detroit Detroit Diesel Cummins

ISX 420 Net HP DDC 60-14.0L S60-14.0 L ISX-400

Tulsa Winch Braden Braden Braden
Wet Kit Wet Kit & HP75A HP-75A Winch HP-75A Winch

180 days 90-150 days 90-150 days 120 days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 30, 2008

For: Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks 

ND

Item Description QTY

08-054

3 Cab & Chassis, Min 50,000 Lbs. GVWR, 
12 CY Dump Trucks

14

Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #1271:
Less trade in Unit #1336:
Less trade in Unit #1337:
Less trade in Unit #1338:
Less trade in Unit #1344:
Less trade in Unit #1345:
Less trade in Unit #1346:
Less trade in Unit #1347:
Less trade in Unit #1348:
Less trade in Unit #1349:
Less trade in Unit #1358:
Less trade in Unit #1362:
Less trade in Unit #1378:
Less trade in Unit #1377:
Total Less trade-ins:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery

4 Deleted

5 Min 35,000 Lbs. GVWR, 2,000 Gallon 
Water Distribution Trucks

4

Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #1232:
Less trade in Unit #1234:
Less trade in Unit #4524:
Less trade in Unit #1235:
Total Less trade-ins:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body

Model of Body

Delivery 

6 Truck, Paint Striper 1
Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #1460:
Total Less trade-in:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery 

Bid #1 Bid # 2
Santex Truck 
Center, Ltd.

Sterling & Western 
Star of Austin, Ltd.

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

French Ellison Truck 
Center

1380 Ackerman Rd. 1700 Smith Rd. 8700 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 9010 IH 10 East
San Antonio, TX 
78219
(210) 661-8371

Austin, TX 78721
(888) 661-8611x134

Converse, TX 
78109
(210) 277-4373

Converse, TX 78109
(210) 277-4373

Converse, TX 
78109
(210) 662-9333

$90,195.00 $89,635.00 $90,377.00 $88,997.00 $101,417.00
$1,262,730.00 $1,254,890.00 $1,265,278.00 $1,245,958.00 $1,419,838.00

$24,000.00 No Bid $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $40,000.00
$23,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00
$23,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00
$23,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00
$21,000.00 No Bid $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $20,000.00
$21,000.00 No Bid $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $20,000.00
$21,000.00 No Bid $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $20,000.00
$21,000.00 No Bid $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $20,000.00
$21,000.00 No Bid $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $20,000.00
$21,000.00 No Bid $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $20,000.00
$23,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00
$23,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00
$23,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00
$23,000.00 No Bid $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00

$951,730.00 $1,254,890.00 $1,127,278.00 $1,107,958.00 $1,119,838.00

International Sterling Freightliner Freightliner 2009 Kenworth
7600 LT 9500 M2-112 M2-112 T-800
Fuller Fuller Fuller Fuller Fuller

FRO-15210 C FRO-15210 C FRO-15210 B FRO-15210 B FRO-15120 C
International Mercedes Mercedes Benz Mercedes-Benz Cummins
 Maxforce13 MBE 400-435HP MBE 4000-450 MBE 4000-450 ISX-450

Davis Ox Body Warren TBEI-Ox Bodies Warren
FMT 1014 14' Maverick 14' Mod. FL651-14 14' Maverick FL-651-14

195 days 90-120 days 120-150 days 75-120 days 120 days

$79,540.00 $75,806.00 $87,793.00 $75,747.00 $82,116.00
$318,160.00 $303,224.00 $351,172.00 $302,988.00 $328,464.00

$13,500.00 No Bid $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $17,000.00
$13,500.00 No Bid $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $17,000.00

Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted Deleted
$13,500.00 No Bid $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $17,000.00

$277,660.00 $303,224.00 $315,172.00 $266,988.00 $277,464.00

International Sterling Freightliner Freightliner 2009 Kenworth
4400 Acterra M2-106 M2-106 T-370

Allison Allison Allison Allison Allison
3000 RDS 3000 RDS 3000 RDS 3000 RDS 3000 RDS

International Cummins Cummins Cummins Paccar 
Maxforce DT 257HP ISB 260 HP ISB 6.7-240HP ISB 6.7 L PX-8 260 HP

CTE CTE Etnyre CTE Ledwell
2200 Gal. Water 

System
Water Distributor-

2200 Gal.
Model 1900 

Pressure Sprinkler
2200 Gal. Water 

System
2000 Gal. Water 

Tank

195 days 90-120 days 120-150 days 75-120 days 120 days

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 30, 2008

For: Medium & Heavy Duty Trucks 

ND

Item Description QTY

08-054

7 Cab & Chassis, Min 35,000 GVWR Lbs,  
Digger Derrick, 120" cab to axle

1

Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #1449:
Total Less trade-in:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery 

8 Cab & Chassis, Min 24,000 GVWR Lbs, 
with flare bodies. 

3

Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit #1180:
Less trade in Unit #1181:
Less trade in Unit #1272:
Total Less trade-ins:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery 

9 Cab & Chassis, Min 35,000 Lbs GVWR, 
with Fuel & Lube Bodies

2

Price Each
Price Total

Less trade in Unit#1091
Less trade in Unit#1092
Total Less trade-ins:

Make of Cab & Chassis
Model of Cab & Chassis
Make of Transmission
Model of Transmission
Make of Engine
Model of Engine
Make of Body
Model of Body

Delivery

Bid #1 Bid # 2
Santex Truck 
Center, Ltd.

Sterling & Western 
Star of Austin, Ltd.

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

Freightliner of San 
Antonio, LTD

French Ellison Truck 
Center

1380 Ackerman Rd. 1700 Smith Rd. 8700 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 9010 IH 10 East
San Antonio, TX 
78219
(210) 661-8371

Austin, TX 78721
(888) 661-8611x134

Converse, TX 
78109
(210) 277-4373

Converse, TX 78109
(210) 277-4373

Converse, TX 
78109
(210) 662-9333

No Bid $166,844.00 No Bid $169,916.00 No Bid
$166,844.00 $169,916.00

$25,000.00 $25,000.00
$141,844.00 $144,916.00

Sterling Freightliner
Acterra M2-106
Allison Allison

3000 RDS 3500 RDS
Cummins Cummins
ISC-315 ISC-315

Altec Altec
D2045 D2045

240-270 days 210-270 days

No Bid $59,603.00 No Bid $55,599.00 No Bid
$178,809.00 $166,797.00

No Bid $3,000.00
No Bid $3,000.00
No Bid $3,000.00

$178,809.00 $157,797.00

Sterling Freightliner
Acterra M2-106
Allison Allison 

2500 RDS 2500 RDS
Mercedes-Benz Cummins 

MBE 900 250HP ISB 6.7
Wabash Wabash 

Custom Built Custom Flare body

90-120 days 75-105 days

$130,098.00 $129,321.00 $151,804.00 $130,250.00 No Bid
$260,196.00 $258,642.00 $303,608.00 $260,500.00

$14,500.00 No Bid $5,000.00 $5,000.00
$14,500.00 No Bid $5,000.00 $5,000.00

$231,196.00 $258,642.00 $293,608.00 $250,500.00

International Sterling Freightliner Freightliner
4400 Acterra M2-106 M2-106

Allison Allison Allison Allison
3000 RDS 3000 RDS 3000 RDS 3000 RDS

International Cummins Cummins Cummins
Maxforce 9 307HP ISC 315 HP ISC-315 ISC 315

CTE CTE IMT CTE 
M150 Lube & Fuel Body Sitestar  16' 6" Fuel & Lube body

200 days 150-180 days 150-210 days 120-180 days
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